

g

AGENDA ITEM REQUEST FORM

Hays County Commissioners Court

Tuesdays at 9:00 AM

Request forms are due in Microsoft Word Format via email by 2:00 p.m. on Wednesday.

AGENDA ITEM

Approve award to multiple vendors for IFB 2013-B04 Road Building Materials.

ITEM TYPE	MEETING DATE	AMOUNT REQUIRED
CONSENT	July 23, 2013	N/A

LINE ITEM NUMBER

AUDITOR USE ONLY

AUDITOR COMMENTS:

PURCHASING GUIDELINES FOLLOWED: N/A

AUDITOR REVIEW: N/A

REQUESTED BY	SPONSOR	CO-SPONSOR
Borcherding/Maiorka	COBB	N/A

SUMMARY

See attached tabulation of all vendors and materials.

Type of Materials	Unit of Measure	Colorado Materials	Centex Mtls LLC	Brauntex	Industrial Asphalt
FOB Plant					
ITEM 247 FLEXIBLE BASE					
TYPE A GRADE 2		\$4.35	\$5.75	\$4.25	\$5.25
ITEM 302 AGGREGATE FOR SURFACE TREATMENT					
Type A Grade 3	Ton	\$11.00	\$15.50	\$9.25	\$13.00
Type A Grade 4	Ton	\$11.00	\$15.50	\$10.75	\$13.00
Type A Grade 5	Ton	\$15.00	\$15.50	\$8.00	\$15.00
PEA GRAVEL	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ITEM 302 PRE-COATED AGGREGATE FOR SURFACE TREATMENT					
Type PA GR 4	Ton	\$30.00	no bid	\$26.75	\$33.00
Type PA GR 5	Ton	\$50.00	no bid	\$26.75	\$33.00
ITEM 334 HOT-MIX/COLD LAID ASPHALT(patching materials)					
Black Base/Cold Mix	Ton	\$70.00	No Bid	\$57.50	\$63.00
CONCRETE FOR STRUCTURES					
PSI 3000 1 1/4" Rock	Cubic Yard	no bid	\$92.00	no bid	no bid
PSI 3000 5/8" Rock	Cubic Yard	no bid	\$99.00	no bid	no bid
PSI 3000 3/8" Rock	Cubic Yard	no bid	\$99.00	no bid	no bid
Manufactured Sand	Ton	\$10.75	\$8.00	\$8.00	\$5.50
3 X 5 Rock	Ton	\$10.00	\$9.25	\$8.50	\$15.00
Pit Locations					

COLORADO MATERIALS - 5080 FM2439 NEW BRAUNFELS, TEXAS 78132
CENTEX MATERIALS - 1100 FM 2770 BUDA, TEXAS 78610
BRAUNTEX MATERIALS - 1504 WALD ROAD NEW BRAUNFELS, TEXAS 78132
INDUSTRIAL ASPHALT & AGGREGATES - 6185 FM 967 BUDA, TEXAS 78610 - 1101 FM 1770 BUDA, TEXAS 78610 - MUSTANG RIDGE 6510 FM 1327 AUSTIN, TEXAS 78747